RODNEY R. PARKER (4110)
RICHARD A. VAN WAGONER (4690)
SNOW CHRISTENSEN & MARTINEAU
10 Exchange Place, Eleventh Floor
Post Office Box 45000
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-5000
Telephone: (801) 521-9000

rrp@scmlaw.com
rav@scmlaw.com

Attorneys for John P. Jurrius and Snow, Christensen & Martineau

STATE OF UTAH

COUNTY OF SALT LAKE

IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT DISTRICT OF UTAH, CENTRAL DIVISION

LYNN D. BECKER,	AFFIDAVIT OF ATTORNEY'S FEES
Plaintiff,	
vs.	
UTE INDIAN TRIBE OF THE UINTAH AND OURAY RESERVATION, et al.,	Case No. 2:16-cv-958-CW
Defendants, Counterclaim and Third-Party Plaintiffs,	Judge Clark Waddoups
VS.	
LYNN D. BECKER, et al.,	
Counterclaim and Third-Party Defendants.	

RODNEY R. PARKER, being first duly sworn, makes the following statement:

) : ss.

)

- 1. I am an attorney for John P. Jurrius in this case and have personal knowledge of the facts set forth herein.
- 2. The basis for an award of attorney's fees is this court's Memorandum Decision and Order of March 31, 2021 (Dkt. 260), which provides in pertinent part:

As such, the Tribe is **HEREBY ORDERED** to pay Becker and Jurrius the fees in prosecuting his matter. This time shall include any and all time expended in, and otherwise related to: drafting the Notice of Intent to Serve Subpoena upon Snow Christensen & Martineau (ECF No. 205); responding to the Motion to Quash (ECF No. 206); drafting the Motion for Protective Order (ECF No. 214); responding to the Order to Show Cause (ECF No. 221); preparing for and attending any hearings held on the same. Becker and Jurrius are **ORDERED** to, within **ten (10) days** of the date of this order, to submit to the court a sworn and itemized statement showing the actual time expended in such matters and the rate at which fees were computed. (*Id.*, p. 27.)

- 3. Attached as Exhibit A is a report from SC&M's accounting system containing detailed descriptions of the attorney's fees incurred in connection with the representation of Mr. Jurrius in this case within the parameters of the court's order, calculated as of April 12, 2021. These entries correspond to the amounts actually billed to the client for the services described.
- 4. I believe that the hourly rates charged are consistent with the prevailing hourly rates in the community for similar services, and that such fees are reasonable.
- 5. The foregoing fees were reasonably necessary in the representation of Mr. Jurrius in this case.

DATED: April <u>12</u>, 2021.

SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN to before me April 2021.

CHERYL A. HUNTER
Notary Public State of Utah
My Commission Expires on:
January 18, 2023
Comm. Number: 704124

Ty Commission Expires:

1-18-2023

NOTARY PUBLIC

-3-

Residing in the State of Utah

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that on April 12, 2021, a true copy of the foregoing AFFIDAVIT OF

ATTORNEY'S FEES was served by the method indicated below, to the following:

David K. Isom ISOM LAW FIRM 299 S. Main Street, Ste. 1300 Salt Lake City, UT 84111 david@isomlawfirm.com	 () U.S. Mail, Postage Prepaid () Hand Delivered () Overnight Mail () Facsimile (X) Electronic Filing
Frances C. Bassett Jeffrey S. Rasmussen Jeremy J. Patterson Thomasina Real Bird PATTERSON EARNHART REAL BIRD & WILSON, 357 S. McCaslin Blvd., Ste. 200 Louisville, CO 80027 fbassett@nativelawgroup.com jrasmussen@nativelawgroup.com jpatterson@nativelawgroup.com trealbird@nativelawgroup.com	() U.S. Mail, Postage Prepaid () Hand Delivered () Overnight Mail LLP () Facsimile (X) Electronic Filing
J. Preston Stieff J. Preston Stieff Law Offices 110 S. Regent St., Ste. 200 Salt Lake City, UT 84111 jps@stiefflaw.com	 () U.S. Mail, Postage Prepaid () Hand Delivered () Overnight Mail () Facsimile (X) Electronic Filing
David Jimenez-Ekman April A. Otterberg JENNER & BLOCK LLP 353 N. Clark Street Chicago, Illinois 60654 djimenez-ekman@jenner.com aotterberg@jenner.com	 () U.S. Mail, Postage Prepaid () Hand Delivered () Overnight Mail () Facsimile (X) Electronic Filing
_/s	/ Rodney R. Parker

4848-3323-9525, v. 1

EXHIBIT A

1	Time Report					
2	Billed and Unbilled					
3		ian Tribe v. Indigena Ho	 dings	 		
4	John Jumas / Ote ma	ian mise v. maigena no	(Z00			
5	Date	Name	Hrs	Amt	Rate	Narrative
6	08/13/2020	RA Van Wagoner	0.25	102.50	410.00	Telephone conference with David Isom regarding subpoena
7	08/18/2020	RA Van Wagoner	0.25	102.50	410.00	Review correspondence; office conference with Rod Parker and David Slaughter; review motion to quash and subpoena from David Isom and notice to court
8	08/20/2020					2020-08-20 BECKER SUBPOENA SERVED ON SCM
9	08/21/2020	RR Parker	0.70	297.50	425.00	Call with Mr. Schaar; email with Ms. Bassett; conference with Rick Van Wagoner
10	08/22/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.50	615.00	410.00	Edit court filing
11	8/23/2020	RA Van Wagoner	0.50			Conference with counsel for Becker regarding retaliation
12	08/24/2020	RA Van Wagoner	2.50			Preparation of motion for protective order; meeting with counsel for Becker; conference with Rod Parker; conference with David Slaughter; review correspondence and objections regarding subpoenas
13	08/25/2020	DW Slaughter	1.20	594.00	495.00	Examine correspondence from Tribe counsel; conference with Rick Van Wagoner concerning motion prompted by Becker subpoena; review/revise draft motion for protective order
14	08/25/2020	RA Van Wagoner	5.50	2,255.00	410.00	Preparation of motion for protective order; preparation of correspondence regarding confidentiality provisions of settlement agreement
15	08/26/2020	DW Slaughter	1.50	742.50	495.00	Further revisions to draft motion for protective order; strategy meeting with Rick Van Wagoner and Rod Parker, including discussion of Tribe counsel request for a pre-hearing conference.
16	08/26/2020	RR Parker	2.00	850.00	425.00	Work on issues regarding Becker Subpoena
17	08/26/2020	RA Van Wagoner	3.50	1,435.00	410.00	Continue preparation of motion for protective order; office strategy conference
18	08/27/2020	DW Slaughter	3.40	1,683.00	495.00	Correspondence and telephone calls with Rick Van Wagoner; review local rules limiting memo length; review and heavy edit of motion for protective order, with related correspondence to "team."
19	08/27/2020	RR Parker	0.50	212.50	425.00	Review of draft memorandum; call with Mr. Van Wagoner
20	08/27/2020	RA Van Wagoner	2.50	1,025.00	410.00	Preparation of motion to quash; correspondence with client
21	08/27/2020	J Archibeque	0.60	105.00	175.00	Compile exhibits to Motion for Protective Order
22	08/28/2020					2020-08-28 [214] Mtn for PO - BECKER Fed Case
23	08/28/2020	RR Parker	3.80	1,615.00	425.00	Meet and confer regarding discovery dispute and upcoming status hearing with arbitrators; call with John Jurrius; revision and filing of Motion for Protective Order in Becker litigation
24	08/28/2020	RA Van Wagoner	2.00	820.00		Preparation of motion for protective order; conference with Rod Parker; meet and confer with Rod Parker and Tribe's counsel; conference with Rod Parker; conference call with Rod Parker and client
25	08/28/2020	J Archibeque	0.20	35.00	175.00	Telephone conference with Karen Johnson regarding hyperlinking dockets to limit pages and exhibits
26	08/31/2020					2020-08-31 OSC HEARING

5	Date	Name	Hrs	Amt	Rate Narrative
27	08/31/2020	DW Slaughter	0.70	346.50	495.00 Examine correspondence/documents from Tribe counsel threatening sanctions in Becker matter; conference with Rick Van Wagoner and Rod Parker ahead of court hearing; posthearing conference with Messrs Van Wagoner and Parker
28	08/31/2020	RR Parker	3.90	1,657.50	425.00 Preparation for and appearance at federal court hearing; follow up and call with client
29	08/31/2020	RA Van Wagoner	2.50	1,025.00	410.00 Review Tribe's correspondence and threats, including Rule 11 letter and motion; conferences and preparation for hearing with Rod Parker and David Slaughter
30	09/01/2020				2020-09-01 [219] Ute Indian Tribe Objection
31	09/01/2020	DW Slaughter	1.10	544.50	495.00 Review correspondence exchange with Tribe counsel; review elements of transcript of 8/31 hearing before Judge Waddoups
32	09/01/2020	RR Parker	2.10	892.50	425.00 Review of various new filings; conferences with Mr. Van Wagoner and Mr. Slaughter
33	09/01/2020	RA Van Wagoner	2.00	820.00	410.00 Review correspondence from the Tribe; telephone conference with counsel; review submissions to court by Tribe; review proposed submission to court; review transcript; correspondence to client
34	09/02/2020	RR Parker	2.00	850.00	425.00 Preparation of response to Tribe's objection to filing of January 15 letter
35	09/02/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.50	615.00	410.00 Review Judge Waddoups' ruling on jurisdictional issues in Becker case; preparation of response to Tribe's objection to submitting the January 15, 2020 letter; conference with Rod Parker
36	09/04/2020				2020-09-04 [221] Order to Show Cause
37	09/04/2020	RR Parker	2.50	1,062.50	425.00 Call with Mr. Jurrius; review of federal court order; internal conferences
38	09/04/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.00	410.00	410.00 Conference call among client, Rod Parker and David Slaughter; telephone conference with counsel
39	09/08/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.50	615.00	410.00 Review court order; various correspondence and telephone conferences (includes weekend)
40	09/14/2020	RR Parker	0.30	127.50	425.00 Email and phone call regarding federal court Order to Show Cause
41	09/14/2020	RA Van Wagoner	2.00	820.00	410.00 Telephone conference with counsel regarding Tribe's responses to Order to Show Cause; review documents provided by the Tribe in-camera; internal correspondence regarding various including Tribe's possible amendment of claims based on SCM/Jurrius filing motion for protective order before Waddoups and Tribe's engagement of Chicago counsel to respond to Order to Show Cause; telephone conferences regarding extension of time sought by Tribe; review correspondence; begin review/preparation of response to Order to Show Cause
42	09/15/2020	DW Slaughter	0.10	49.50	495.00 Brief conference with Rick Van Wagoner on court order allowing modest extension for Tribe's response to Order to Show Cause
43	09/15/2020	RR Parker	0.40	170.00	425.00 Conference with Mr. Van Wagoner; phone call with David Isom
44	09/15/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.00	410.00	410.00 Review new defense counsel's motion; review court order; telephone conference with David Isom; conference with Rod Parker and David Slaughter
45	09/16/2020	RR Parker	0.90	382.50	425.00 Call with Mr. Jurrius; conference with Mr. Van Wagoner

5	Date	Name	Hrs	Amt	Rate Narrative
46	09/16/2020	RA Van Wagoner	0.75	307.50	410.00 Conference call with client and Rod Parker regarding status of
					federal matter and arbitration
47	09/18/2020	RR Parker	0.60	255.00	425.00 Call with Mr. Van Wagoner; call with David Isom; review of
					Tenth Circuit status report in Becker case
48	09/18/2020	RA Van Wagoner	0.50	205.00	410.00 Review Tribe's filing in Tenth Circuit; correspondence with
					counsel
49	09/22/2020	DW Slaughter	0.30	148.50	495.00 Strategy / status meeting with Rick Van Wagoner, Rod Parker
					and Becker attorney David Isom
50	09/23/2020	RA Van Wagoner	0.50	205.00	410.00 Review correspondence from Chicago counsel; telephone
					conference with David Isom
51	09/24/2020				2020-09-24 [226] MOTION for Extension of Time to Respond to
					the Courts September 4, 2020 Order to Show Cause
52	09/24/2020	DW Slaughter	0.00	0.00	0.00 [No Charge] review proposed letter to Tribe's Chicago counsel
					concerning disclosures to court, with revisions.
53	09/24/2020	RR Parker	1.80	765.00	425.00 Call with Mr. Jurrius; preparation of letter to April Ottenberg
54	09/24/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.50	615.00	410.00 Telephone conference with client; review Tribe's requested
					changes in arbitration claims; preparation of correspondence to
					Chicago counsel
55	09/25/2020				2020-09-25 [228] Tribe's RESPONSE TO ORDER TO SHOW
					CAUSE re [221] Order to Show Cause
56	09/25/2020	RA Van Wagoner	0.50	205.00	410.00 Telephone conference with David Isom; review correspondence;
					review/prepare correspondence
57	09/28/2020	RA Van Wagoner	2.00	820.00	410.00 Review Tribe's principal filing in federal court in response to
					Order to Show Causes; lengthy conference with counsel for
					Becker regarding same
58		09/29/2020			2020-09-29 [229] MOTION for Leave to File Response to the
					Tribe's Response
59		09/29/2020			2020-09-29 [230] Tribe's Response to Motion re [229] MOTION
					for Leave to File Response to the Tribe's Response
60	09/29/2020	DW Slaughter	0.30	148.50	495.00 Examine Tribe response to Court's Orders to Show Cause
61	09/29/2020	DW Slaughter	0.50	247.50	495.00 Review/revise motion to court for leave to address show-cause
					order concerning retaliation, with related correspondence with
					Rick Van Wagoner
62	09/29/2020	RR Parker	0.40	170.00	425.00 Conference with Mr. Van Wagoner; review of filings
63	09/29/2020	RA Van Wagoner	4.00	1,640.00	410.00 Preparation of motion for leave to fie response to Tribe's
					response to Second Order to Show Cause and for clarification;
					correspondence with client; begin preparation of response to
					Tribe's response to Second Order to Show Cause; conference
					with Rod Parker
64	09/30/2020	DW Slaughter	0.40	198.00	495.00 Strategy conference with Rod Parker on discovery issues
65	09/30/2020	RR Parker	2.00	850.00	425.00 Review of recent filings
66	09/30/2020	RA Van Wagoner	7.00	2,870.00	410.00 Preparation of reply to Tribe's response to second Order to
					Show Cause
67	10/01/2020	RA Van Wagoner	4.60	1,886.00	410.00 Continue preparation of reply to Tribe's response to Order to
					Show Causes; telephone conference with David Isom regarding
					various; conference with Rod Parker
68	10/02/2020	RA Van Wagoner	4.90	2,009.00	410.00 Lengthy meeting with Becker counsel regarding responses to
					Order to Show Causes; continue work on replies to Tribe's
					responses to Order to Show Causes

5	Date	Name	Hrs	Amt	Rate Narrative
69	10/03/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.50	615.00	410.00 Review Becker's draft declaration and draft memo regarding the first Order to Show Cause; continue preparation of Jurrius' reply to Tribe's response to second Order to Show Cause; correspondence with Rod Parker and David Slaughter
70	10/05/2020	RR Parker	2.70	1,147.50	425.00 Review of draft submission to federal court; work on Memorandum in Opposition to Motion to File Amended Statement of Claims
71	10/05/2020	RA Van Wagoner	7.00	2,870.00	410.00 Continue preparation of reply to Tribe's response to second Order to Show Cause; preparation of exhibit list; preparation of reply to tribe's response to first Order to Show Cause; various correspondence with Rod Parker, David Slaughter and Jenn Archibeque
72	10/06/2020	DW Slaughter	0.50	247.50	495.00 Review/revise draft memo responding to Tribe position on first order to show cause, with related correspondence with Rick Van Wagoner
73	10/06/2020	RR Parker	4.50	1,912.50	425.00 Work on federal court responses
74	10/06/2020	RA Van Wagoner	7.00	2,870.00	410.00 Continue preparation of reply to Tribe's response to First and Second Order to Show Causes; preparation of Declaration of Rod Parker; conference call with Rod Parker and David Isom regarding procedural history; correspondence with client
75	10/06/2020	J Archibeque	0.80	140.00	175.00 Compile exhibits to be attached to Second Order to Show Cause
76	10/07/2020	DW Slaughter	1.00	495.00	495.00 Review memo to court on order to show cause, with further revisions; conference with Rick Van Wagoner and Rod Parker to coordinate strategy between arbitration and Becker litigation and related refinements to filings and documents.
77	10/07/2020	RR Parker	5.00	2,125.00	425.00 Work on responses to pending motions
78	10/07/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.00	410.00	410.00 Conference call among Rod Parker, David Slaughter and Jenn Archibeque regarding preparation of replies to Tribe's responses to Order to Show Causes; conference call among Rod Parker and David Isom
79	10/07/2020	J Archibeque	0.60	105.00	175.00 Conference call with attorneys Rick Van Wagoner, David Slaughter and Rod Parker regarding response to Order to Show Cause and conference with Rod Parker regarding exhibits
80	10/08/2020	RR Parker	6.00	2,550.00	425.00 Work on responses to pending motions
81	10/08/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.00	410.00	410.00 Preparation of reply to Tribe's response to Second Order to Show Cause
82	10/09/2020				2020-10-09 [234] Becker's Memorandum Regarding Tribe's Filed Documents
83	10/09/2020				2020-10-09 [235] Becker's Response to Order Regarding Sanctions Against Ute Tribe
84	10/09/2020				2020-10-09 [236] Ex 10-20 to Becker's Response to OSC
85	10/09/2020				2020-10-09 [237] Ex 21-30 of Becker's Response to OSC
86	10/09/2020				2020-10-09 [238] Jurrius response to first OSC
87	10/09/2020				2020-10-09 [239] Reply in supp of [229] motion for leave to file response to second OSC
88	10/09/2020	RR Parker	5.50	2,337.50	425.00 Completed and filed memoranda in federal case and Memorandum in Opposition to Motion to File Amended Statement of Claims

5	Date	Name	Hrs	Amt	Rate Narrative
89	10/09/2020	RA Van Wagoner	4.00	1,640.00	410.00 Continue preparation of documents for today's filing;
					conference call with client and Rod Parker; telephone conference with Rod Parker; review Becker filings in federal
90	10/09/2020	J Archibeque	2.20	385.00	court; review Becker filings 175.00 Compile, organize and revisions to exhibits to exclude markups;
	, ,	·			conference with Rick Van Wagoner regarding exhibits and finalize same; conferences with Rod Parker regarding exhibits
91	10/12/2020	RR Parker	4.50	1,912.50	425.00 Conferences with Rick Van Wagoner and David Slaughter
91	10/12/2020	NN Parker	4.50	1,912.50	regarding last week's filings; work on response to Motion to Compel
92	10/12/2020	RA Van Wagoner	2.00	820.00	410.00 Reviewed memorandum decision by Judge Waddoups in Becker
					matter regarding a number of issues including those raised in
					Becker's reply to Tribe's response to Second Order to Show
					Cause
93	10/13/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.00	410.00	410.00 Begin review of Becker declaration and exhibits
94	10/14/2020				2020-10-14 [240] ORDER granting [229] Motion for Leave to
					File a Response
95	10/14/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.00	410.00	410.00 Continue review of declaration and exhibits; review court order;
					correspondence to client; telephone conference with David Isom
					regarding court order; correspondence to Rod Parker regarding
0.0	40/45/2020	DA 1/ 14/	4.20	402.00	redacted settlement agreement
96	10/15/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.20	492.00	410.00 Complete review of Becker filing
97	10/21/2020	RR Parker	2.00	850.00	425.00 Strategy conference with David Slaughter and Rick Van
98	10/21/2020	RA Van Wagoner	0.75	307.50	Wagoner; review of Becker filings 410.00 Strategy meeting with Rod Parker and David Slaughter
99	10/23/2020	NA vali wagonei	0.75	307.30	2020-10-23 [243] Ute Tribe's Reply Re Court's 9-4-20 OSC
100	10/24/2020	RA Van Wagoner	0.25	102.50	410.00 Telephone conference with David Isom regarding Tribe's
100	10/24/2020	NA van vvagoner	0.23	102.50	response
101	10/25/2020	RA Van Wagoner	0.50	205.00	410.00 Meeting with David Isom regarding Tribe's response
102	10/27/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.40	574.00	410.00 Review filing by Tribe in Reply regarding Order to Show Cause;
					telephone conference with Rod Parker
103	10/28/2020	RR Parker	3.80	1,615.00	425.00 Preparation and filing of Motion to Stay
104	10/31/2020	DW Slaughter	0.30	148.50	495.00 Examine correspondence from Rick Van Wagoner with copy of
					Tex Arrowchis affidavit of feared retribution; related exchange
					with Rick Van Wagoner
105	10/31/2020	RA Van Wagoner	1.00	410.00	410.00 Telephone conference and meeting with David Isom regarding
					Arrowchi
106	11/02/2020	RA Van Wagoner	2.50	1,025.00	410.00 Revise documents relating to sanctions - Arrowchis filing
107	11/03/2020				2020-11-03 [244] Becker's Mtn to File Surreply to Tribe's Reply
108	11/03/2020	RA Van Wagoner	2.00	820.00	410.00 Continue preparation of sur-reply and various correspondence
					with counsel for Becker; review correspondence from Tribe's
					counsel in arbitration; preparation of correspondence to client
109	12/02/2020				2020-12-02 [Dkt. 251] Findings of Fact
110	12/02/2020	RA Van Wagoner	0.75	307.50	410.00 Review Judge Waddoups' decision on remand from Tenth
					Circuit;correspondence with Rod Parker and client regarding Judge Waddoups' decision
111	12/08/2020	RA Van Wagoner	0.25	102.50	410.00 Telephone conference with David Isom regarding federal case
112	01/06/2021	DW Slaughter	0.20	99.00	495.00 Correspondence with Rod Parker and Rick Van Wagoner
					concerning strategy in dealing with likely and competing timing
					of federal court hearing on sanctions and arbitration hearing

114 01/ 115 02/ 116 02/ 117 02/ 118 02/ 119 02/ 120 02/	2/09/2021 2/09/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021	RA Van Wagoner RR Parker RA Van Wagoner RR Parker RA Van Wagoner DW Slaughter RR Parker RA Van Wagoner RA Van Wagoner	0.20 3.00 0.50 4.50 0.20 0.80	410.00 85.00 1,230.00 212.50 1,845.00 102.00 340.00 1,230.00	425.00 410.00 425.00 410.00 510.00	Preparation of exhibit list; telephone conference with David Isom regarding federal court matter; correspondence regarding federal court matter Emails regarding Judge Waddoups' contempt hearing Various correspondence regarding Cleve Pike; preparation of motion for leave and beginning of analysis for Supplement to Reply to Tribe's Response to Second Order to Show Cause in the Becker case Conference with Rick Van Wagoner regarding Cleve Pike Telephone conference with Cleve Pike; preparation of Pike declaration; correspondence with private investigator for service of subpoena; conference with Rod Parker Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's recording request; conference with Rick Van Wagoner
115 02/ 116 02/ 117 02/ 118 02/ 119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/09/2021 2/09/2021 2/09/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021	RA Van Wagoner RR Parker RA Van Wagoner DW Slaughter RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.50 4.50 0.20	1,230.00 212.50 1,845.00 102.00 340.00	425.00 410.00 425.00 410.00 510.00	federal court matter Emails regarding Judge Waddoups' contempt hearing Various correspondence regarding Cleve Pike; preparation of motion for leave and beginning of analysis for Supplement to Reply to Tribe's Response to Second Order to Show Cause in the Becker case Conference with Rick Van Wagoner regarding Cleve Pike Telephone conference with Cleve Pike; preparation of Pike declaration; correspondence with private investigator for service of subpoena; conference with Rod Parker Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
115 02/ 116 02/ 117 02/ 118 02/ 119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/09/2021 2/09/2021 2/09/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021	RA Van Wagoner RR Parker RA Van Wagoner DW Slaughter RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.50 4.50 0.20	1,230.00 212.50 1,845.00 102.00 340.00	425.00 410.00 425.00 410.00 510.00	Emails regarding Judge Waddoups' contempt hearing Various correspondence regarding Cleve Pike; preparation of motion for leave and beginning of analysis for Supplement to Reply to Tribe's Response to Second Order to Show Cause in the Becker case Conference with Rick Van Wagoner regarding Cleve Pike Telephone conference with Cleve Pike; preparation of Pike declaration; correspondence with private investigator for service of subpoena; conference with Rod Parker Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
115 02/ 116 02/ 117 02/ 118 02/ 119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/09/2021 2/09/2021 2/09/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021	RA Van Wagoner RR Parker RA Van Wagoner DW Slaughter RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.50 4.50 0.20	1,230.00 212.50 1,845.00 102.00 340.00	425.00 410.00 510.00 425.00	Various correspondence regarding Cleve Pike; preparation of motion for leave and beginning of analysis for Supplement to Reply to Tribe's Response to Second Order to Show Cause in the Becker case Conference with Rick Van Wagoner regarding Cleve Pike Telephone conference with Cleve Pike; preparation of Pike declaration; correspondence with private investigator for service of subpoena; conference with Rod Parker Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
116 02/ 117 02/ 118 02/ 119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/09/2021 2/09/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021	RR Parker RA Van Wagoner DW Slaughter RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.50 4.50 0.20 0.80	212.50 1,845.00 102.00 340.00	425.00 410.00 510.00 425.00	motion for leave and beginning of analysis for Supplement to Reply to Tribe's Response to Second Order to Show Cause in the Becker case Conference with Rick Van Wagoner regarding Cleve Pike Telephone conference with Cleve Pike; preparation of Pike declaration; correspondence with private investigator for service of subpoena; conference with Rod Parker Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
117 02/ 118 02/ 119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021	RA Van Wagoner DW Slaughter RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.20 0.80	1,845.00 102.00 340.00	425.00 410.00 510.00 425.00	Reply to Tribe's Response to Second Order to Show Cause in the Becker case Conference with Rick Van Wagoner regarding Cleve Pike Telephone conference with Cleve Pike; preparation of Pike declaration; correspondence with private investigator for service of subpoena; conference with Rod Parker Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
117 02/ 118 02/ 119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021	RA Van Wagoner DW Slaughter RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.20 0.80	1,845.00 102.00 340.00	425.00 410.00 510.00 425.00	Becker case Conference with Rick Van Wagoner regarding Cleve Pike Telephone conference with Cleve Pike; preparation of Pike declaration; correspondence with private investigator for service of subpoena; conference with Rod Parker Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
117 02/ 118 02/ 119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021	RA Van Wagoner DW Slaughter RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.20 0.80	1,845.00 102.00 340.00	425.00 410.00 510.00 425.00	Conference with Rick Van Wagoner regarding Cleve Pike Telephone conference with Cleve Pike; preparation of Pike declaration; correspondence with private investigator for service of subpoena; conference with Rod Parker Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
117 02/ 118 02/ 119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021	RA Van Wagoner DW Slaughter RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.20 0.80	1,845.00 102.00 340.00	410.00 510.00 425.00	Telephone conference with Cleve Pike; preparation of Pike declaration; correspondence with private investigator for service of subpoena; conference with Rod Parker Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
117 02/ 118 02/ 119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021 2/10/2021	DW Slaughter RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.20	102.00	410.00 510.00 425.00	Telephone conference with Cleve Pike; preparation of Pike declaration; correspondence with private investigator for service of subpoena; conference with Rod Parker Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/10/2021	DW Slaughter RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.80	340.00	510.00 425.00	declaration; correspondence with private investigator for service of subpoena; conference with Rod Parker Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/10/2021	RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.80	340.00	510.00 425.00	service of subpoena; conference with Rod Parker Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/10/2021	RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.80	340.00	510.00 425.00	Conference with Rick Van Wagoner including review of Cleve Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
119 02/ 120 02/ 121 02/	2/10/2021	RR Parker RA Van Wagoner	0.80		425.00	Pike affidavit Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
120 02/ 121 02/	2/10/2021	RA Van Wagoner			425.00	Review of draft Cleve Pike declaration; review of Tribe's
120 02/ 121 02/	2/10/2021	RA Van Wagoner				
121 02/		-	3.00	1 220 00		
121 02/		-		1.230.00	410.00	Continue preparation of Pike affidavit and proposed
	2/12/2021	RA Van Wagoner		_,		supplementation in federal court
	-/ 12/ 2021	Tot van tvagoner	1.50	615.00		Various trial preparations; meeting with Rod Parker regarding
122 02/		i i	1.50	013.00		Becker and Pike; conference call with client and Rod Parker;
122 02/						revise declaration
122 02/	7/18/2021	RA Van Wagoner	1.75	717.50		Continue preparation of federal court supplement and filing
	2/10/2021	NA van wagoner	1.75	717.50		regarding witness intimidation and harassment; conference call
						with client and Rod Parker
122 02	1/10/2021	RR Parker	4.00	1 700 00		
	2/19/2021 2/19/2021		4.00	1,700.00 410.00		Work on filings in federal court related to Cleve Pike
124 02/	2/19/2021	RA Van Wagoner	1.00	410.00		Continue preparation of declaration and motion for leave to
						supplement; conference call with client and Rod Parker
125 02	1/22/2021	DD Daylean	0.70	207.50		regarding same
125 02/	2/22/2021	RR Parker	0.70	297.50		Emails and conferences regarding scheduling, Cleve Pike
126 02	122/2024	DA \/\A/	2.00	020.00		declaration
126 02/	2/22/2021	RA Van Wagoner	2.00	820.00		Correspondence with client; finalize declaration;
						correspondence with Cleve Pike; preparation of Motion to
127 02	122/2024					Supplement in federal court
	2/23/2021	DD Davidson	1.00	600.00		2021-02-23 [252] [Tribe] Motion to Reconsider
128 02/	2/23/2021	RR Parker	1.60	680.00		Revision of Cleve Pike motion; review of Tribe's motion to
120 02	2/22/2024	24.77	1.00	440.00		reconsider
129 02/	2/23/2021	RA Van Wagoner	1.00	410.00		Continue preparation of Motion to Supplement; review Tribe's
	10.1000					latest filing in federal court
	2/24/2021	RR Parker	0.20	85.00		Conference and follow up regarding Cleve Pike declaration
	2/25/2021	RR Parker	0.20	85.00		Review of new draft of Cleve Pike declaration
132 02/	2/25/2021	RA Van Wagoner	1.20	492.00		Telephone conference with client; revise declaration;
						correspondence with client; correspondence with Cleve Pike
133 02/	2/26/2021	RR Parker	2.20	935.00		Work on Cleve Pike declaration; call with John Jurrius;
						preparation of initial outline for Judge Waddoups' Order to
						Show Cause hearing
134 02/	2/26/2021	RA Van Wagoner	1.00	410.00		Review revised Pike declaration; conference with Rod Parker;
						telephone conference with John Jurrius and Rod Parker
						regarding same and upcoming hearing on Order to Show Causes
135 03/	3/02/2021	RA Van Wagoner	0.25	102.50	410.00	Telephone conference regarding Cleve Pike
136 03/	3/08/2021	RA Van Wagoner	1.75	717.50	410.00	Review and edit response to tribe's filing in federal court
137 03 /	3/09/2021					2021-03-09 [253] MEMORANDUM in Opposition re [252]
						MOTION to Amend_Correct [251] Findings of Fact &
						Conclusions of Law

5	Date	Name	Hrs	Amt	Rate 1	Narrative
138	03/11/2021	RA Van Wagoner	1.75	717.50	410.00	Telephone conference with counsel; telephone conference with
					F	Rod Parker; review and revise outline for hearing before Judge
					١	Waddoups
139	03/14/2021	RA Van Wagoner	0.50	205.00	410.00	Telephone conference with David Isom regarding Order to Show
					(Cause hearing
140	03/15/2021				2	2021-03-15 HEARING ON OSC
141	03/15/2021	RR Parker	7.80	3,315.00		Preparation for and appearance at federal court hearing; calls
					ā	after hearing; email to court attaching requested document
142	03/15/2021	RA Van Wagoner	4.00	1,640.00	410.00	Conference call with client; conference call with David Isom
					r	regarding Order to Show Cause hearing; preparation with Rod
					F	Parker for hearing; attend Order to Show Cause hearing; debrief
					\	with client; debrief with Mr. Isom
143	03/23/2021	RR Parker	0.10	42.50	425.00 F	Review of Tribe's Reply in Support of Motion to Reconsider in
					t	the Becker case
144	03/30/2021				2	2021-03-30 [259] Order denying Tribe's motion to reconsider
145	03/30/2021	RR Parker	0.60	255.00	425.00	Call from John; review of decision in Becker
146	03/30/2021	RA Van Wagoner	0.50	205.00	410.00 F	Review Judge Waddoups' decision; telephone conference with
					F	Rod Parker; review correspondence
147	03/31/2021				2	2021-03-31 [260] Memorandum Decision and Order (OSC)
148	03/31/2021	DW Slaughter	0.50	255.00	510.00 F	Review Judge Waddoups ruling/order on show-cause matters;
					r	meeting with Rod Parker and Rick Van Wagoner concerning
					5	strategy in arbitration in light of court's findings and order
149	03/31/2021	RR Parker	1.00	425.00	425.00 F	Review of Judge Waddoups' Memorandum Decision and Order
					((OSC); conference with Rick Van Wagoner and David Slaughter
150	04/01/2021				2	2021-04-01 [261] Order (placing docs in public record)
151	04/02/2021	RR Parker	2.00	850.00		Assembled data for use in attorney's fee claim in Becker case
152	04/09/2021	RR Parker	3.80	1,615.00	425.00 \	Work on fee application
153	04/09/2021	RA Van Wagoner	1.25	512.50		Preparation of fee application
154		RA Van Wagoner	1.00	410.00		Preparation of fee application
155	04/12/2021	RR Parker	2.80	1,190.00		Completed and filed fee application
153			227.30	94,502.50		